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Rajarshi Shahu Mahavidyalaya, Latur 
(Autonomous) 

Department of Commerce  
Activity Report 2019-20 

 
The following activities were arranged by the department during the academic year 2019-20. 
 
Sr. 
No. Program Particulars 

 

1 Live Budget  
(5 July 2019) 

The live Central Budget 
presented by the Finance 
Minister Nirmala 
Sitaraman was shown to 
the Commerce Students. 
(UG & PG Students were 
present for this program) 

 

2 
Parent – Students 
– Teachers Meet  
(8 July 2019) 

Hon’ble Principle 
Dr.M.H.Gavhane was the 
president for this 
program. During this 
program placement 
officer, Prof. Rahul 
Athawle given the 
information regarding 
placement cell. 
Dr.O.V.Shahapurkar, 
CoE of Autonomous 
College guided for 
examination pattern and 
passing criteria. Vice-
Principal Dr.A.J.Raju 
given the information 
about the departmental 
activities. B.Com. I year 
and M.Com. I year 
students and all staff 
members were present 
for the program. 

 
 

 

3 
Carrier Guidance 
(CMA) 
9 July 2019 

Carrier Guidance on Cost 
Accounting as a 
profession by Shri. Parag 
Rane, Chairman of 
ICMA, Aurangabad 
Forum. 
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4 

Students 
Induction 
Program 
(10-11 July 2019) 

As per the UGC 
Guidelines or 
Department has 
organized Two Days 
Students Induction 
Program for newly 
admitted students. First 
Day Hon’ble Principal 
Dr.M.H.Gavhane, CoE 
Dr.O.V.Shahapurkar, 
Registrar Shri. 
S.P.Chavhan given the 
guidelines on their 
respective subject. On 
Second Day mentor-
mentee allotment was 
made by B.Com. I year 
coordinator 
Dr.V.D.Dhumal. Various 
programs like singing, 
poem reading, story, 
mimicry etc. programs 
were arranged for the 
students. In afternoon 
session the meeting of 
respective mentor-
mentee was arranged. 

 
 

 

5 

Multiple 
Intelligence 
Program 
(14 July 2019) 

In collaboration with 
ICAI Branch of latur was 
organized a guest lecture 
for the Commerce 
Students particularly 
who are interested in 
CA/CS program. The 
lecture was delivered by 
Mrs. Padmini Panse, 
Pune. 

 

6 
Elocution 
Program 
(17 July 2019) 

Elocution competition on 
“Environmental 
Deterioration: Causes 
and Remedies” was 
organized for the 
selection of office 
bearers of Commerce 
Association. 25 students 
were participated in this 
competition. 

 

7 

Entrepreneurship 
Development 
Program 
(23 July 2019) 

Entrepreneurship 
Development Program 
was organized by Dept. 
of Commerce and 
MCED Latur to create 
awareness among 
students about self 
employments. Project 
director of MCED Shri 
Narayan Bhosale guided 
to the students of B. Com 
and M. com. around 75 
students participated in 
this program. 
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8 

Guest Lecture on 

C.A. Foundation 

(25 July 2019) 

Guest Lecture for C.A. 

Foundation Student was 

Organised. Hon’ble 

Principal Dr. Mahadev 

Gavhane is the President 

and Dr.Chandrakant 

Halnikar Guided the 

Students regarding the 

carrier guidance and 

DYSP Sachin Sangle 

Guided on how to 

achieve our Goals.  

 

9 

Entrepreneurship 

Development 

Program 

(25 July 2019) 

Entrepreneurship 

Development Program 

was organized by Dept. 

of Commerce and Vishav 

Kalyan Mission, Latur to 

create awareness among 

students about 

Entrepreneurship. 

Padmabhushan Dr. 

Ashokji Kukde Kaka and 

Hon. Dr. Goplaraoji 

Patil, President of SCSS, 

latur inaugurated the 

function.  Well-known 

Entrepreneurs motivated 

to the students to become 

entrepreneurs and to take 

initiative with start-ups.  

 

 
 

10 

Inaugural 

Function of 

commerce 

Association   

(8 Aug. 2019) 

Commerce Association 

Inaugural function was 

organized on 8th August 

2019 the chief guest for 

the inaugural function 

was Mr.Ravi Bapatle, 

Sevalaya, Hasegaon. The 

chairperson of this 

program was Principal 

Dr.Mahadev Gavhane. 
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11 

Teachers Day 

Program  

(23rd Sept. 2019) 

Teachers Day program 

was organized by 

Association of 

Commerce on 23rd Sept. 

2019. The chairperson of 

this program was HoD 

Dr.A.J.Raju.  

 
 

12 
Dandiya 
Competition  
(6 Oct. 2019) 

Dandiya Competition 
was organized by 
Commerce Department 
on 6th Oct. 2019.  
The chairperson of this 
program was HoD 
Dr.A.J.Raju and the 
guest was Mrs.Anita 
Thakur & Mrs. Pooja 
Parsewar. 

 

 
 

13 

National Two 
Days Conference  
(14th & 15th Oct. 
2019 

National Two Days 
conference was arranged 
by Department of 
Commerce on “Recent 
Economic Policies and 
Its Impact on Indian 
Economy” Dated on 14th 
& 15th Oct. 2019. The 
Chairperson of this 
program was 
Dr.Gopalraoji Patil. 

 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 

HoD 


